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Long-Term Care Survey Alert

Education: 4 Ways to Get a Bigger Bang for the Buck From Professional
Conferences
Check out these preparation and notetaking tips.

Attending a conference is a great opportunity to glean the latest information and meet new professional contacts who
can share what works well in their care settings.

To achieve these goals, experts suggest these strategies.

1. Do your homework. "If you chose a conference, there's something about the agenda that appeals to you," says Kurt
Haas, RN, former Ohio survey agency chief and currently CEO of Nursing Home Perspectives. "So look at the agenda
and prepare questions. Speakers may not be able to answer the questions but they will likely be able to point you in the
right direction."

2. Capture the highlights. Haas recommends taking some notes rather than just relying on the handouts. "When you take
notes, you're writing what 'speaks to you' about the information which is probably something you don't know or haven't
thought about.

There's always going to be a significant portion of the information that you know. It's the exceptions that you want to
focus on."

Organize your materials: Many conferences have stopped providing notebooks, but you can take one with the printed
handouts in it. Include a section or few pages to jot down novel ideas from case study presentations or answers to
questions about MDS coding, as examples.

Remember: A clever tip that reduces negative outcomes can be worth its weight in gold, risk-management-wise. For
example, at the 2009 American Association of Homes & Services for the Aging annual meeting, one facility director of
nursing shared how her facility staff used a timer set for 15 minutes to take turns staying with a resident who was falling
frequently due to a UTI. They used the strategy for a couple of days until his antibiotic started working and he stopped
falling. (See "A Simple Strategy Can Head Off Falls and Related Injuries," in Long-Term Care Survey Alert, Vol. 12, No. 3.)

3. Expand your circle of contacts. If you know just one person at a reception or other networking event, you've got a
connection, says Maribeth Kuzmeski, MBA, author of The Connectors: How the World's Most Successful
Businesspeople Build Relationships and Win Clients for Life. Walk up to that person and chat for a while, Kuzmeski
suggested in an interview with Eli. Then ask the person: "Who here does your marketing or your quality assurance or
who's your director of nursing and ask to be introduced to that person."

Tip: "If you don't know anyone at all, lingering at the refreshment table as you get some food and beverage is a good
place to strike up a conversation," Kuzmeski advised. "Or get a plate of food and look for someone sitting alone or a
group at a table with empty chairs and ask if they mind if you join them."

When MDS expert Rena Shephard, RN, RAC-MT, CNE, MHA, attends conferences related to her role as a legal nurse
consultant, for example, she may "strike up conversations" with people around her before or after a session. "Drawing
the speaker into that discussion can be really helpful if you can do that," says Shephard, founding board chair and
executive editor for the American Association of Nurse Assessment Coordinators.

4. Develop a standard format for reporting on conferences. You can do oral presentations for staff as part of meetings or
inservices. But providing a concise (one page or so) written format can help you share the highlights and any insights,
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including care tips, new contacts and other helpful information (XYZ facility is launching a new quality initiative for med
reconciliation).


